
 

Software  

 
Logos Bible Software offers SBL members a 25% discount on all 
Logos Basic Products (does not include add-on modules).  

Subscriptions  

 
Monash University Press extends a 20% discount to SBL members 
for their on-line journal for biblical studies: The Bible and Critical 
Theory  

 
Sage Publications offers discounts to SBL members on their 
journals for biblical studies including Expository Times, Journal for 
the Study of the New Testament, Journal for the Study of the Old 
Testament, Journal of Anglican Studies, Currents in Biblical 
Research, Studies in Christian Ethics, Theology and Sexuality, 
Feminist Theology, Journal of Pentecostal Theology, Journal for 
the Study of the Historical Jesus, Journal for the Study of 
Pseudepigrapha, Aramaic Studies, and the Journal of Moral 
Philosophy.  

Books  

 

SBL books and affiliate publications go on sale twice a year at a 
40% discount, in conjunction with SBL regional meetings in the 
spring and the SBL Annual Meeting in the fall. Even if you don't go 
to the meetings, you can get the discount through the SBL Store. 
The promotional code and time restraints are provided via e-mail to 
current SBL members.   

 Over one hundred religion book publishers exhibit at the various 
SBL meetings. Exhibitors offer deep discounts to SBL member 
attendees. The exhibitors are listed in the program books of the 
meetings. Check for information on publishers booth locations at 
the SBL meeting at their websites.  

Other Discounts  
 Other discounts become available throughout the year. Registration 

for SBL meetings is discounted for members. SBL negotiates travel 
discounts for members attending the International Meeting and 
Annual Meeting. These are posted in the Congresses section and 
only appear as they become available.  

 

Questions About Your Membership?  

 Toll free number: 866-727-9955  
 From outside North America: call 01-404-727-9498   
 Fax: 404-727-2419  
 Email us at: sblservices@sbl-site.org   


